
  

 
 
 

ANNEX A 

2019 – 2020 AWARD RECIPIENTS  
 
IMDA VOLUNTEER PARTNER AWARD (2019-2020) 

No. Organisation Name Contribution 

1 Grab Singapore  Grab Singapore has partnered IMDA to organise the Merdeka 

Generation Digital Clinics in 2019 to equip seniors with digital skills. 

Together with IMDA, the MG Digital Clinics benefitted close to 

3,500 seniors. 

2 Institute of Technical 

Education (ITE)  

The Silver Infocomm Fiesta (SIF) in 2019 was jointly organized with 
IMDA to bring seniors for a series of IT classes throughout the year 
to equip them with basic digital skills. More than 100 classes were 
held at ITE at the SIF and 2,000 seniors were trained on basic 
digital skills like communication skills, using government digital 
apps and e-payments. 

3 RSVP Singapore The 

Organisation of 

Senior Volunteers 

RSVP Singapore is one of IMDA’s Silver Infocomm Junctions, 
which serves as a learning hub for seniors to embark on their digital 
learning journey. They started offering affordable IT courses in 
1998 and became the first IMDA appointed SIJ in 2007. They had 
also co-organised the Silver Infocomm Fiesta 2019 with IMDA to 
train and help more than 2,000 seniors pick up digital skills. 

4 Standard Chartered 

Bank Singapore 

Standard Chartered Bank (Singapore) Limited has been a 

supportive partner of IMDA’s signature programmes. Getting 

seniors to be digitally ready is a key aspect of the Bank's “Silver 

Lining” community initiative which focuses on helping the elderly in 

our rapidly ageing population. Since 2017, over 650 staff 

volunteers had participated in IMDA’s Digital Clinic initiative, Digital 

Inclusion Festival and the Silver Infocomm Fiesta. 

5 Youth Corps 

Singapore 

Youth Corps Singapore (YCS) has worked closely with IMDA to 

scale the Digital Learning Circles programme in 2020 to equip 

seniors at the Senior Activity Centres (SAC) with basic digital skills 

so that the seniors can remain meaningfully connected in the digital 

society. To date, YCS has deployed 409 youth volunteers at 54 

SAC, where these volunteers have engaged more than 1,000 

seniors. Prior to that, YCS partnered IMDA in their Digital Clinic 

programme as well as the Digital Inclusion Festival in 2019. 

  

TOP 3 INDIVIDUAL VOLUNTEERS WITH THE MOST VOLUNTEERING HOURS (2019) 

No. Name of Volunteer Contribution 

1 Ms TEO Wee Lee 

Winnie 

Age: 79 

Winnie has been supporting Cyberguide classes as assistant 
trainer. Some of the classes she has supported are Digital Banking 
(EL) and Using Whatsapp (EL). Winnie also volunteers at least 
once a week at the Cyberguide registration counter in helping 
members of the community to sign up for Cyberguide courses. With 
the knowledge she has gained while supporting cyberguide 
classes as assistant trainer, she is able to advise the public on 
suitable courses to sign up for. 

2 Ms HO Piak Khoon 

Age: 66 

Piak Khoon has been assisting participants to sign up for 
Cyberguide classes at the registration counter and she has 
supported many Cyberguide classes as assistant trainer. Some of 
the classes she has supported as assistant trainer are Google 



  

 
 
 

Photos 6Hr (EL) and Maximising Usage of Samsung Smartphone 
9Hr (EL). 

3 Mr TANG Chee Mun 

Age: 73 

Mr Tang has been consistently volunteering himself once every 
week for 3 hours in helping participants to decide on courses 
suitable for them and assisting them to sign up for the cyberguide 
classes and pay via skillsfuture credits. His patient and gentle 
demure has helped participants to be comfortable in consulting him 
on the suitable courses to sign up for.  

 
TOP 3 INDIVIDUAL VOLUNTEERS WITH THE MOST VOLUNTEERING HOURS (2020) 

No. Name of Volunteer Contribution 

1 Mr Marcus Foo Jun 

Rong 

Age: 23 

Volunteered with Code in the Community to teach coding to 

students from underprivileged backgrounds. 

 

2 Ms Huin Wai Mun 

Age: 44 

3 Ms Andrea Yeo Xin 

Hui 

Age: 30 

 
SPECIAL RECOGNITION TO DONORS AND SPONSORS 

No. Organisation Name Contribution 

1 Google Contributed S$1M (USD748,000) to co-fund the Code In The 

Community programme to bring free coding classes to students from 

the underprivileged background. 

2 NetLink Management 

Pte Ltd 

Contributed $400K as donation to IMDA Digital Access Programme, 

facilitated by Community Chest. The donation was utilised as a last-

mile assistance to help those who cannot afford the co-payment of 

subsidised personal computers and connectivity, as well as fiber 

broadband registration.  

3 Standard Chartered 

Bank Singapore  

Contributed $400K as donation to IMDA Digital Access Programme, 

facilitated by Community Chest. The donation was utilised as a last-

mile assistance to help those who cannot afford the co-payment of 

subsidised personal computers and connectivity, as well as fiber 

broadband registration. 

4 ST Engineering Contributed $1M as donation to IMDA Digital Access Programme, 

facilitated by Community Chest. The donation was utilised as a last-

mile assistance to help those who cannot afford the co-payment of 

subsidised personal computers and connectivity, as well as fiber 

broadband registration. The donation will also include co-payment to 

provide fully subsidised smartphones for needy seniors under the 

Mobile Access for Seniors scheme.  

5 ST Telemedia GDC 

Pte Ltd 

Contributed $500K as donation to IMDA Digital Access Programme, 

facilitated by Community Chest. The donation was utilised as a last-

mile assistance to help those who cannot afford the co-payment of 

subsidised personal computers and connectivity, as well as fiber 

broadband registration. 

 


